MKRS LLC / BRILL GANG

Kevin Brill
(FL. Broker

license #
, BK3036789)

‘8 Judge Stephanie R. Silver (FL. Bar #417343)

J Miami Dade County Civil Division. Court location: Miami Beach, FL. (USA).
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Judge Silver chose to be corrupt instead of obeying the law.

Who would pay $1,850 rent for a one bedroom (700 sq. ft.) without having any keys to the

apartment, the missing lock on the front door that can only stay closed with a piece of paper

stuck, and the windows hospitable to weather and heat. Judge Silver apparently would.
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Sarah Brill

Sun, Sep 11, 9:29 AM

- Good morning, the reason

why I'm late for the rent is
that | cannot find a roommate,
because the front door lock is
broken, the back door has to
stay open at all time,

unlocked to be able to get
back in the apartment . No
one will accept to leave with
the door open, pay a rent
with a door always unlocked,
but | will do my best to pay
the rest within 2 weeks.

Mon, Sep 12, 8:31 AM

Hello.that is not an excuse. . i
need you to pay this week 1/2
and 1/2 the following week

If not the corporation will put

an evict
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Sara Brill, YES... it’s by law according to Florida Statute
83.51.- Landlord’s obligation to maintain the premises
and according to Florida Statute 83.60 (1) (b) “A material
noncompliance with 83.51(1) by the landlord is a
complete defense to an action for possession based upon
nonpayment of rent, and, upon hearing, the court shall
determine the amount, if any, by which the rent is to be
reduced to reflect the diminution in value of the dwelling
unit during the period of noncompliance with 83.51(1).”
Either way... it's the judge who decides whether the
money should be deposited in the court registry, NOT the
landlord...BUT Jerome had no intention of staying...
September rent was paid in full under pressure,
harassment, threats, bullying tactics, and October paid in
full with the last security month ... he just wanted to get
his deposit back and move out... He moved out and he's
still waiting for Mark Brill to pay him back his deposit as
he promises by email. It means Mark Brill defaming
Jerome by claiming he was trying to extend the eviction
process and twisted the law by claiming Jerome had to
pay rent into court registry... then Judge Stephanie Silver
unsurprisingly acts as the Brill gang’s puppet.

Screenshot of the email from Jerome to Mark Brill regarding his move and deposit ... so,
Judge Silver “Order Writ of Possession” filed on Nov. 30, 2022... does NOT make sense.
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mrkbrill@yahoo.com, ke... 11/28/2022
| NEED MY DEPOSIT URGENT Fwd: 993 B...
My deposit, please.Jerome VincentiBegin
forwarded message:From: Jerome F.

¥

mrkbrill@yahoo.com 11/27/2022
Fwd: DEPOSIT URGENT Fwd: 993 Bay Dr ...
My deposit, please.Jerome VincentiBegin
forwarded message:From: Jerome F.

¥

mrkbrill@yahoo.com 11/27/2022
DEPOSIT URGENT Fwd: 993 Bay Dr #4
Mark Brill Despite the financial hardships,
MKRS, LLC., deliberately caused me in

® mrkbrill@yahoo.com 11/16/2022
Motion to Strike Plaintiff lies ¢
Here find the Motion to strike Plaintiff
Motion and Defendant Request to the

mrkbrill@yahoo.com 11/16/2022
Evidence and Consequences. ¢
Find attached document Evidence of my
claim filled with the Court.

Laure Faiveley 11/15/2022
Animal planet @ '
This message has no text content.

Laure Faiveley 11/15/2022

Ryan brill ¢
This message has no text content. .
here to search I! (@]
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@5, Jerome F. Vincenti Nov 27, 2022 at 10:14 AM
To: mrkbrill@yahoo.com Details

DEPOSIT URGENT Fwd: 993 Bay Dr #4

Mark Brill,

Despite the financial hardships, MKRS, LLC., deliberately caused me in violation of Florida Statute 83.51, | was able to leave 993 Bay
Dr., Apt. 4, 33141, Miami Beach, FL., a dangerous location unsuitable for safe residential tenancy.

So, as you promised me by email and put in writing on the public record with the Court, | respectfully request my security deposit
($1,850), which is not rent nor can it be used as rent, according to the lease agreement between me, Jerome Vincenti and MKRS,
LLC., extorted from me by MKRS, LLC., in violation of Florida Statute 836.05 Threats, extortion, with the strange persistence of
MKRS, LLC. owners, including you, Mark Brill, to refuse to inspect the premises before and after | Zelle transferred my damage
deposit ($1,850) to MKRS, LLC., bank account, which became a subject of blackmail in your mind to illegally force me out despite
the $600 rent paid to KMRS, LLC., used for November, in addition of my rent security deposit of $1850 used for October.

So, as you already know, any property left in the premises belongs to the previous leaseholder and any damages you may claim are
the legal liability of the previous tenant, Evan Vehslage, from whom you also took a damage deposit of an amount of $1,350.

| obviously need my $1850 damage deposit ASAP.

Zelle's transfer of the $1,850 damage deposit to my bank account will constitute proof of reimbursement of my damage deposit
($1,850) by MKRS, LL., of which I will notify the court and law enforcements from which your illegal activities against me were
reported.

Jerome Vincenti.
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